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Alerts

1 event
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2003204099 Pearl oyster post-operation resting 31 Mar 2010

2003239435 DVD game 31 Mar 2010

2003254491 Cutting device 31 Mar 2010

2003268275 Methods for up-regulating antigen expression in tumors 31 Mar 2010

2003274960 Brachytherapy apparatus 31 Mar 2010

2003277006 Therapies for chronic inflammatory demyelinating polyneuropathy using interferon-beta 31 Mar 2010

2003282874 A method of forming a sheet material for bending along a bend line and a sheet formed
for such bending

31 Mar 2010

2003285229 Gastrin compositions and formulations, and methods of use and preparation 31 Mar 2010

2003298445 Application of inert gas mixtures to prevent and/or to control sulfide mineral oxidation
and the generation of acid rock drainage

31 Mar 2010

2003299903 Contraceptive device and delivery system 31 Mar 2010

2004221069 Method and system for a data transmission in a communication system 31 Mar 2010

2004221090 Admission control and resource allocation in a communication system supporting quality
of service

31 Mar 2010

2004224053 Oestrogen derivatives as inhibitors of steroid sulphatase 31 Mar 2010

2004227754 Apparatus and method for detecting radiation or radiation shielding in shipping containers 31 Mar 2010

2004233705 Preventives or remedies for hepatopathy 31 Mar 2010

2004237408 Medical use of inhibitors of glutaminyl and glutamate cyclases 31 Mar 2010

2004254872 Motor 31 Mar 2010

2004277311 Benzo (4, 5) thieno (2, 3-d) pyrimidin4-ones and their use in therapy 31 Mar 2010

2004289318 Crystalline topotecan hydrochloride product and preparation thereof 31 Mar 2010

2005222004 Coating agent composition 31 Mar 2010

2005232566 Alkylamine as an antimicrobial agent in ophthalmic compositions 31 Mar 2010

2005269736 Method and apparatus for randomnumber generator 31 Mar 2010

2005282480 Treatment of diseases using nalmefene and its analgos 31 Mar 2010

2005309680 Digital data interface device 31 Mar 2010

2005319774 A process for the production of paper 31 Mar 2010

2005326149 Antibiotic 107891, its factors A1 and A2, pharmaceutically acceptable salts and
compositions, and use thereof

31 Mar 2010

2005337423 Water conservation means 31 Mar 2010

2006214247 Boron-containing small molecules 31 Mar 2010

2006220374 Cattle management system and method 31 Mar 2010

2006229744 Emulation of film image's tonescale and color 31 Mar 2010

2006247296 A vehicle locating unit with improved power management method 31 Mar 2010

2006266232 Diaphragm latch valve 31 Mar 2010

2006285712 Method of producing saccharide compositions starting with biomass 31 Mar 2010

2006309597 COATING APPARATUS 31 Mar 2010

2007201359 Reliability detection of channel quality indicator (CQ1) and application to outer loop
power control

31 Mar 2010
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2007234610 Methods and systems to distribute content via a network utilizing distributed conditional
access agents and secure agents, and to perform digital rights management (DRM)

31 Mar 2010

2007251283 Triazolopyrazine derivatives useful as anti-cancer agents 31 Mar 2010

2007272240 Multiple piece construction automotive door hinge 31 Mar 2010

2007306086 Composition 31 Mar 2010

2007323999 Asphalt shingle coating with improved tear strength 31 Mar 2010

2007356889 System and method for transferring electrical power between grid and vehicle 31 Mar 2010

2007357775 Transmitting apparatus, receiving apparatus and communication method 31 Mar 2010

2008200381 Human monoclonal antibodies to dendritic cells 31 Mar 2010

2008212038 Worldwide cash vendor payment 31 Mar 2010

2008225556 Mobile communication method, radio base station, and upper level node 31 Mar 2010

2008227516 Arsenic-containing solid material and method for production thereof 31 Mar 2010

2008259948 Table construction 31 Mar 2010

2008268087 Fiber laser having superior resistance to reflection light 31 Mar 2010

2008277887 Reinigung pegylierter polypeptide 31 Mar 2010

2008281112 Use of KCNQ potassium channel openers for reducing symptoms of or treating disorders
or conditions wherein the dopaminergic system is disrupted

31 Mar 2010

2008282807 Composition, production and use of sorbent particles for flue gas desulfurization 31 Mar 2010

2008284025 Therapeutic use of anti-tweak receptor antibodies 31 Mar 2010

2008284172 Removing vibration noise from multicomponent streamer measurements 31 Mar 2010

2008284919 Database management program and database management device 31 Mar 2010

2008286027 Derivatives of 1-phenyl-2-pyridinyl alkyl alcohols as phosphodiesterase inhibitors 31 Mar 2010

2008286770 Bicyclic sphingosine 1-phosphate analogs 31 Mar 2010

2008288797 Detection and classification of matches between time-based media 31 Mar 2010

2008290002 Mobile communication system, user device and merhod 31 Mar 2010

2008291431 Steel for producing machine components formed from solid stock 31 Mar 2010

2008291873 Non-aqueous pharmaceutical compositions 31 Mar 2010

2008292085 Carrier-free orodispersible and/or dispersible solid composition with noticeable effect and
method for preparing same

31 Mar 2010

2008292336 Painting material charging device 31 Mar 2010

2008292607 Two-axle truck for a railway car and a railway car 31 Mar 2010

2008293037 Humidity control apparatus 31 Mar 2010

2008295643 Vacuum cleaner 31 Mar 2010

2008298926 Isoquinolinyl and isoindolinyl derivatives as histamine-3 antagonists 31 Mar 2010

2008300921 Coated detergent composition and manufacture process 31 Mar 2010

2008301913 Compositions and methods for diagnosis and treatment of type 2 diabetes 31 Mar 2010

2008331929 Method and system for inflight refueling of unmanned aerial vehicles 31 Mar 2010

2009212916 System for loading and unloading loose cargo in a cargo hold, preferably of a plane, and
intermediate conveyor means or conveyor unit herefor

31 Mar 2010

2009901065 Management System and Method 31 Mar 2010

2009906287 Aeration device 31 Mar 2010

2010200658 Pilot ransmission and channel estimation for multiple transmitters 31 Mar 2010

2010900396 Estimation or weather modification effects 31 Mar 2010

2010900494 Respiratory Syncytial Virus {RSV) 31 Mar 2010
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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